
Texts on Christ’s Sinless Human Nature

Matthew 27:4: “Saying, I have sinned in that I have betrayed the innocent blood. And they said, What is 
that to us? see thou to that.”

Matthew 27:19: “When he was set down on the judgment seat, his wife sent unto him, saying, Have thou 
nothing to do with that just man: for I have suffered many things this day in a dream because of him.”

Mark 1:24: “Saying, Let us alone; what have we to do with thee, thou Jesus of Nazareth? art thou come to 
destroy us? I know thee who thou art, the Holy One of God.”

Luke 1:35: “And the angel answered and said unto her, The Holy Ghost shall come upon thee, and the 
power of the Highest shall overshadow thee: therefore also that holy thing which shall be born of thee 
shall be called the Son of God.”

Luke 4:34: “Saying, Let us alone; what have we to do with thee, thou Jesus of Nazareth? art thou come to 
destroy us? I know thee who thou art; the Holy One of God.”

Luke 23:41: “And we indeed justly; for we receive the due reward of our deeds: but this man hath done 
nothing amiss.”

Luke 23:47: “Now when the centurion saw what was done, he glorified God, saying, Certainly this was a 
righteous man.” 

John 8:46: “Which of you convinceth me of sin? And if I say the truth, why do ye not believe me?”

John 9:24: “Then again called they the man that was blind, and said unto him, Give God the praise: we 
know that this man is a sinner.”

John 10:36: “Say ye of him, whom the Father hath sanctified, and sent into the world, Thou blasphemest; 
because I said, I am the Son of God?”

John 14:30: “Hereafter I will not talk much with you: for the prince of this world cometh, and hath noth-
ing in me.”

John 19:4: “Pilate therefore went forth again, and saith unto them, Behold, I bring him forth to you, that 
ye may know that I find no fault in him.”

Acts 3:14: “But ye denied the Holy One and the Just, and desired a murderer to be granted unto you.”

Acts 4:27, 30: “For of a truth against thy holy child Jesus, whom thou hast anointed, both Herod, and 
Pontius Pilate, with the Gentiles, and the people of Israel, were gathered together ... By stretching forth 
thine hand to heal; and that signs and wonders may be done by the name of thy holy child Jesus.”



Romans 8:3: “For what the law could not do, in that it was weak through the flesh, God sending his own 
Son in the likeness of sinful flesh, and for sin, condemned sin in the flesh.”

II Corinthians 5:21: “For he hath made him to be sin for us, who knew no sin; that we might be made 
the righteousness of God in him.”

Hebrews 4:14-16: “Seeing then that we have a great high priest, that is passed into the heavens, Jesus the 
Son of God, let us hold fast our profession. For we have not an high priest which cannot be touched with 
the feeling of our infirmities; but was in all points tempted like as we are, yet without sin. Let us therefore 
come boldly unto the throne of grace, that we may obtain mercy, and find grace to help in time of need.”

Hebrews 7:26-28: “For such an high priest became us, who is holy, harmless, undefiled, separate from 
sinners, and made higher than the heavens; Who needeth not daily, as those high priests, to offer up 
sacrifice, first for his own sins, and then for the people’s: for this he did once, when he offered up himself. 
For the law maketh men high priests which have infirmity; but the word of the oath, which was since the 
law, maketh the Son, who is consecrated for evermore.”

I Peter 2:22-23: “Who did no sin, neither was guile found in his mouth: Who, when he was reviled, reviled 
not again; when he suffered, he threatened not; but committed himself to him that judgeth righteously.”

I Peter 3:18: “For Christ also hath once suffered for sins, the just for the unjust, that he might bring us to 
God, being put to death in the flesh, but quickened by the Spirit.”

I John 3:5: “And ye know that he was manifested to take away our sins; and in him is no sin.”


